LANARK PW-C-08-2025-2025-E0
COUNTY
Culvert Replacement

Closing Date: Tuesday, February 11, 2025

Submission Summary

Vendor Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes Unofficial Value or Notes
Schedule "A" Elphin-Maberly Road Schedule "B" McDonalds Schedule "C" Elm Grove Road Schedule "D" River Road Schedule "E" Blakeney Road
(CR#36) Corners Road (CR#12) (CR#21) (CR#11) {CR#17)
G Tackaberry & Sons Construction Company Limited No Bid No Bid $64,792.00 No Bid No Bid
11799746 Canada Incorporated No Bid No Bid $139,289.22 $61,498.60 $59,573.25
Goldie Mohr Ltd. $100,344.00 $147,135.00 $58,480.00 $26,420.00 $23,325.00
Arnott Brothers Construction $105,130.00 $150,945.00 $74,070.00 $28,300.00 $27,575.00
Crains' Construction Limited $129,855.00 $161,700.00 $62,140.00 $36,450.00 $42,430.00
Amazing Construction Ltd $133,234.00 $178,060.00 $68,600.00 $33,600.00 $33,625.00
Master Utility Division Inc $150,139.00| $171,510.00 $76,360.00 $30,550.00 $29,895.00
Strong Bros. General Contracting Ltd. $173,850.00 $192,125.00 $95,500.00 $48,900.00 $51,800.00
Tarstone Canada Limited $203,586.66 $270,631.45 $103,787.06 $52,592.40 $64,607.22
Strathmar Jretthing Ltd $222,736.39 $262,982.63 $114,413.16 $62,637.95 $56,274.70

Tuesday, February 11, 2025
Sean Darouin, P hf&wf‘; Manager Date

(,]Joaw Pratt Tuesday, February 11, 2025

Joan Pratt, Business Manager Public Works Date




